
BASE BID

Item No. Quantity Unit Item Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount

1 1 LS Mobilization, Bonds & Insurance 9,000.00$           9,000.00$  18,011.36$        18,011.36$          26,938.00$         26,938.00$         23,140.00$         23,140.00$         60,000.00$         60,000.00$         

2 1 LS Erosion Control Plan 10,817.00$         10,817.00$            22,047.95$        22,047.95$          2,050.00$           2,050.00$           7,800.00$           7,800.00$           15,000.00$         15,000.00$         

3 4.92 ACRES Removal & On-Site Disposal of Vegetation around WWTP Ponds 6,283.00$           30,912.36$            33,091.69$        162,811.10$        19,485.00$         95,866.20$         13,422.76$         66,039.98$         7,700.00$           37,884.00$         

4 2,300 CY Excavation & Transportation of Clay Linear Material 12.55$  28,865.00$            28.08$  64,583.55$          32.43$  74,589.00$         20.72$  47,656.00$         17.14$  39,422.00$         

5 1 LS Temporary Cofferdam & Dewater Pond D 41,668.80$         41,668.80$            NO BID NO BID 73,000.00$         73,000.00$         208,416.00$       208,416.00$       124,000.00$       124,000.00$       

6 2,300 CY Pond D Earthen Liner Material Berm 15.20$  34,960.00$            40.15$  92,351.95$          82.87$  190,601.00$       24.62$  56,626.00$         131.86$  303,278.00$       

7 1 LS Install Piping, Gate Valves, Concrete Weir Box 51,186.20$         51,186.20$            75,176.41$        75,176.41$          46,619.00$         46,619.00$         107,120.00$       107,120.00$       58,525.00$         58,525.00$         

8 1 LS Install All Metering Equipment 51,186.20$         51,186.20$            36,274.68$        36,274.68$          63,320.00$         63,320.00$         120,350.00$       120,350.00$       58,900.00$         58,900.00$         

** 258,595.56$          471,256.99$        572,983.20$       **** 637,147.98$       697,009.00$       

ALTERNATE BID 1

Item No. Quantity Unit Item Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount Unit Cost Amount

A1 1 LS Replace Base Bid Item 5: Dewater Pond D & Provide Bypass Pumping 12,543.80$         12,543.80$            34,242.68$        34,242.68$          25,829.00$         25,829.00$         46,800.00$         46,800.00$         NO BID NO BID

229,470.56$          *** 505,499.67$        525,812.20$       475,531.98$       NO BID

I, SAGE DILLER, P.E., #96645, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THE ABOVE REFERENCED BIDS WERE RECEIVED, IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE ADVERTISED PROCEDURES, 

OPENED, AND READ ALOUD.  THE BID TABULATION HEREIN IS A TRUE AND ACCURATE REPRESENTATION OF THE BIDS READ ALOUD.

SAGE DILLER, P.E., #96645

 B3 Land Services, LLC
dba B3 Excavation 

 Hack-Co Excavation & Site 
Services, Inc. 

TOTAL ALTERNATE BID 1 PRICE (Base Bid Items 1-4, 6-8 + Alternate A1 )

TOTAL BASE BID PRICE (Items 1 thru 8)

** Due to calculation error, B3 Excavation's Base Bid is higher than what was read aloud at the Bid Opening.

Enprotec / Hibbs & Todd, Inc., 402 Cedar Street, Abilene, Texas 79601

TABULATION OF BIDS FOR: WWTP Imp. Phase II - Stabilization Pond D Modifications, Crockett County WCID #1

PE Firm Registration No. 1151

BIDS RECEIVED: 4/6/2026

 B3 Land Services, LLC
dba B3 Excavation 

Dowtech Specialty Contractors

 Hack-Co Excavation & Site 
Services, Inc. 

**** Due to calculation error, MTL Construction, LLC's Base Bid is lower than what was read aloud at the Bid Opening.

*** Due to calculation error, Hack-Co Excavation & Site Services, Inc.'s Alternate Bid is higher than what was read aloud at the Bid Opening.

MTL Construction, LLC

Dowtech Specialty Contractors MTL Construction, LLC

Dorado Construction Group

Dorado Construction Group
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